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Understanding made upon signature (10 December 1982) and confirmed upon ratification (8 
May 1984)  

1. The signing of the Convention by the Government of the Republic of the Philippines shall not 
in any manner impair or prejudice the sovereign rights of the Republic of the Philippines under 
and arising from the Constitution of the Philippines. 

2. Such signing shall not in any manner affect the sovereign rights of the Republic of the 
Philippines as successor of the United States of America, under and arising out of the Treaty of 
Paris between Spain and the United States of America of 10 December 1898, and the Treaty of 
Washington between the United States of America and Great Britain of 2 January 1930. 

3. Such signing shall not diminish or in any manner affect the rights and obligations of the 
contracting parties under the Mutual Defence Treaty between the Philippines and the United 
States of America of 30 August 1951 and its related interpretative instruments; nor those under 
any other pertinent bilateral or multilateral treaty or agreement to which the Philippines is a 
party. 

4. Such signing shall not in any manner impair or prejudice the sovereignty of the Republic of 
the Philippines over any territory over which it exercises sovereign authority, such as the 
Kalayaan Islands, and the waters appurtenant thereto. 

5. The Convention shall not be construed as amending in any manner any pertinent laws and 
Presidential Decrees or Proclamation of the Republic of the Philippines; the Government of the 
Republic of the Philippines maintains and reserves the right and authority to make any 
amendments to such laws, decrees or proclamations pursuant to the provisions of the Philippines 
Constitution. 

6. The provisions of the Convention on archipelagic passage through sea lanes do not nullify or 
impair the sovereignty of the Philippines as an archipelagic State over the sea lanes and do not 
deprive it of authority to enact legislation to protect its sovereignty, independence and security. 

7. The concept of archipelagic waters is similar to the concept of internal waters under the 
Constitution of the Philippines, and removes straits connecting these waters with the economic 
zone or high sea from the rights of foreign vessels to transit passage for international navigation. 

8. The agreement of the Republic of the Philippines to the submission for peaceful resolution, 
under any of the procedures provided in the Convention, of disputes under article 298 shall not 
be considered as a derogation of Philippines sovereignty. 


